
As approved by the Board of Trustees on June 19, 2024 

Amendment 1 

Amend Article V – Board of Trustees, Section 4 as shown below: 

“Section 4: Election and Vacancies 

Trustees are elected by ballot at the Annual Congregational Meeting. 

(a) The Nominating Committee, described in Article VI, Section 1, will follow the 
procedure set forth in that section to make nominations for the Board of Trustees. Any 
other eligible Member of the Congregation may be nominated for the office of Trustee, 
provided that such nomination is (i) made in writing, (ii) signed by at least 10 Members 
of the Congregation, and (iii) filed with the Secretary of the Board at least 21 days before 
the Annual Congregational Meeting. No one may be nominated without their consent.” 

Amendment 2 

Amend Article VI – Nominating Committee, Section 1 as shown below: 

“ARTICLE VI -- Nominating Committee  

Section 1: Eligibility and Election  

The Nominating Committee consists of nine (9) members elected for three (3) year 
terms, with three (3) new members elected each year at the Annual Congregational 
Meeting to replace three (3) who complete their terms. Individuals who have been 
Members of the Congregation for at least two (2) consecutive years are eligible to be 
elected to the Nominating Committee. No Nominating Committee member who has 
served for 24 or more consecutive months is eligible for re-election until after an 
interval of one (1) year.  Section 2: Call for Nominations  

Not less than 60 days before the Annual Congregational Meeting, the Nominating 
Committee will notify the Congregation by email or U.S. mail that it is requesting 
nominations to the Board of Trustees and the Nominating Committee. After receiving 
suggestions from Members of the Congregation, the Nominating Committee will 
prepare a list of nominees for new Trustees and Nominating Committee members. This 
list will be distributed to the Congregation by email or U.S. mail not less than 14 days 
before the Annual Congregational Meeting. Nominations for Trustee other than those 
made by the Nominating Committee, if any, will be distributed at the same time. No one 
may be nominated without their consent. 

Section 3: Vacancies  

Vacancies occurring on the Nominating Committee after the Annual Congregational 
Meeting will be filled by the Board of Trustees.” 


